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MEOW QUILT

WHAT YOU’LL NEED

•	2m Panel fabric - 16 of the panel squares 
will be used in the quilt and the outside 
length of the fabric used for the side 
borders of the quilt. 

•	2m continuous print fabric for top and 
bottom border

•	20cm of 5 assorted fabrics to be used for 
the HST through the quilt

•	2m background fabric

•	3.5m Backing fabric

•	60cm binding fabric

•	2 metres cotton/polyester batting

•	Matching Gutterman 100% cotton thread

•	Rotary cutter, mat and quilters ruler

•	Quilting pins, tape measure

•	Scissors, seam ripper

•	Hand sewing needle

•	Sewing machine foot and walking foot

•	Marking pen

All fabric should be 100% cotton, washed 
and pressed.  ¼ seam allowance is used 
throughout unless indicated. 

Please read all instructions carefully before 
commencing the quilt. 

Terms:

WOF – Width of Fabric

HST – Half Square Triangle

INSTRUCTIONS:

Note:   While each block is constructed in 
the same way, the blocks are placed in 4 
different directions throughout the quilt.  
Refer to the Diagram for layout. 

Cutting Instructions

Panel Fabric

Carefully cut a 3” strip from each outside 
edge of the length of the 2m long panel.  
This strip will be used for the sides of the 
outside border of the quilt. 

Carefully cut 16 panels to measure 9.5” 
square (to be used as the main fabric for 
each of the 16 blocks).

Continuous print fabric – Following the lines 
of the fabric, cut 2 x 3.5” wide strips from 
the length of the fabric.  This will be used for 
the top and bottom of the outside border. 

Background fabric

Cut 5 x strips across WOF 5.5” wide. 
Crosscut to yield 32 x 5.5” squares.

Cut 3 x strips across WOF 5” wide. Crosscut 
to yield 16 x 5” squares.

5 x assorted fabrics

Cut 1 x strip of each fabric across WOF 5.5” 
wide.   Crosscut to yield 32 x 5.5” squares. 

Step 1 – Rule a line diagonal across each of 
the background 5.5” squares.  

Step 2 - Gather the 5.5” background and all 
5.5” mixed fabric squares.   

Step 3 – With right sides facing, place 
each background 5.5” square with a mixed 
fabric square.  Pin together to hold the two 
squares together. 

Step 4 – Sew a line ¼ inch along each side  
of the ruled line of the background fabric.   

Step 5 – Using your rotary cutter and 
ruler, cut on the ruled line. You should now 
have two HST squares. Repeat this for all 
remaining 5.5” squares resulting in a total  
of 64 squares. Press open.

EASY
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Step 6 – Trim 64 x HST squares to measure 
5” square. 

Making the block

Step 1 - Referring to Diagram gather the 
following fabric pieces: 

•	 Meow Panel 9.5” square x 1 

•	 5” square of background fabric x 1

•	 5” HST squares (2 pairs) x 4

Step 2 – Referring to the diagram, sew the 
two pairs of HST squares together.  Press 
seams. 

Step 3 – Sew one pair to the 5” background 
square.  Press seams. 

Step 4 – Sew the other sewn pair to a 
section to the Meow panel (referring to 
Diagram and ensuring that you have the 
panel facing the correct direction).  Press 
seams. 

Step 5 – Sew the long remaining section to 
the other side of the Meow panel, matching 
seams where they intersect.  Press seams.   

Step 6  – Repeat Steps 8 to 10 for the 
remaining 15 blocks.   You will need to 
ensure that you follow the layout with the 4 
directions of the blocks ensuring that each 
Meow panel is facing the correct direction.

Step 7 – Sew your blocks together, using  
the layout diagram as your reference to 
ensure that you have the correct placement 
for your blocks and matching seams.   
Press seams. 

Step 8 – Sew your rows together, using the 
layout diagram as your reference, matching 
seams.  Press seams. 

Step 9 – Sew your side borders on.  Press 
Seams. 

Step 10 – Sew your top borders on.  Press 
seams. 

Step 11 – Cut backing fabric in half and join 
together to create one large backing piece. 

Step 12 – Lay the backing, batting and quilt 
top and baste together.  Quilt as desired.

Step 13 – Join binding strips, fold in half and 
iron.  Sew binding around quilt.



MEOW QUILT LAYOUT DIAGRAM

The information on this project sheet is presented in good faith, but no warranty  
is given, nor results guaranteed. Quantities and selections may vary at each store.  
Copyright Spotlight 2022.



HALF SQUARE TRIANGLE

MEOW QUILT BLOCK DIAGRAM

Sewing Line
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